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.DESCRIPTION AND USES                              . 

Paint Plus™ Insecticide Paint Additive is designed to kill 
crawling insects when exposed to treated surfaces. 

.PRODUCTS                                                                 . 

SKU Description      
262484 1.6 fluid ounces  

.PRODUCT APPLICATION                                       . 

SURFACE PREPARATION 

Clean food/feed handling or processing equipment and 
thoroughly rinse with clean, fresh water. After application 
in bakeries, clean all food contact surfaces thoroughly with 
the appropriate cleaning equipment.  

Spot or Crack & Crevice Applications 

Except in federally inspected meat and poultry plants, spot 
or crack and crevice applications may be made while the 
facility is in operation, provided exposed food is covered or 
removed from the area being treated prior to the 
application. Do not apply directly to food or food-handling 
surfaces. In the home, do not allow coating to contact 
food/feed surfaces. If contact is made, clean immediately 
with soap and water. 

Residential Applications 

Apply paint Plus Insecticide treated coating to surfaces of 
buildings, porches, window frames, eaves, patios and 
garages to control spiders, ticks, American and German 
cockroaches, silverfish, imported and southern fire ants 
and leafcutter ants. Do not apply to furniture, swing sets or 
other outdoor playground articles. 

Environmental Hazards 

To protect the environment, do not allow pesticide to enter 
or run off into storm drains, drainage ditches, gutters or 
surface waters. Applying this product in calm weather 
when rain is not predicted for the next 24 hours will help 
ensure that wind or rain does not blow or wash pesticide 
off the treatment area. Rinsing application equipment over 
the treated area will help avoid run off to water bodies or 
drainage systems. 

It is in violation of Federal law to use this product in a 
manner inconsistent with its labeling. 

In order to ensure the efficacy of the formulated latex 
coating, the amount of latex coating formulated should not 
exceed the amount that can be applied within three hours 
and all site application should be completed within the first 
three hours after mixing. For oil-based coatings, stains, 
varnish or sealers, the amount of coating formulated 
should not exceed the amount that can be applied within 6 
hours. 

Do not allow children or pets to enter the treated area 
until the surfaces are dry. 

 

 

 

 PRODUCT APPLICATION (cont.)                           . 

MIXING DIRECTIONS 

Add the contents (1.66 fluid ounces) to 1 gallon of latex 
coating (water-based), oil-based coating and stains or 
sealers; then mix well to ensure proper dilution. 

EQUIPMENT 

Apply treated coating with a brush, roller or conventional 
airless equipment.  

PEST CONTROL INDOORS 

Treatment Sites: When sued in accordance with label 

directions, Paint Plus Insecticide treated coating may be 
applied in and on residential and non-residential buildings 
and structures including residential kitchens and all types 
of food/feed handling establishments. This product can be 
applied to non-food contact surfaces of walls, floors, 
ceilings, in and around cabinets, behind and beneath 
equipment and appliances, around floor drains, window 
and door frames and around plumbing, sinks and other 
possible pest harborage sites. The treated coating can be 
applied only as a crack and crevice or spot treatment 
indoors. Do not use for broadcast interior applications 
such as entire walls, ceilings and floors. Permitted areas 
of use include, but are not limited to food/feed and non-
food/non-feed areas. 

Do not apply to classrooms when in use. Do not use in 
aircraft cabins. Do not apply this product in occupied 
patient rooms or in any rooms/areas while occupied by 
patients, the elderly or infirm. Do not apply to institutions 
including libraries, sport facilities or in the immediate area 
when occupants are present.  

Pantry Pest Control: To kill adult and accessible stages 

of insect pests such as spiders, ticks, cockroaches and 
ants, make application to cupboards, shelving and storage 
areas. Remove all foodstuffs, all utensils, shelf paper and 
other objects before coating with the Paint Plus Insecticide 
treated coating. Allow all treated surfaces to dry and cover 
shelves with clean paper prior to replacing foodstuffs, 
utensils or other items. Any foodstuff accidently 
contaminated with any coating solution should be 
discarded.  

Crawling Insect Pests: Insect pests include spiders, 

ticks, cockroaches, mosquitoes, imported and southern 
fire ants, leafcutter ants and silverfish. Apply Paint Plus 
Insecticide treated coating to localized areas of walls, 
ceilings and other resting areas as a crack and crevice or 
spot treatment. The treated coating may be used inside 
residential buildings, in and around carports, garages, 
storage sheds, unoccupied horse stables and per kennels. 
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 PRODUCT APPLICATION (cont.)                           . 

Pet Kennels: For residential control of crawling and flying 

insects in and around these structures, apply to cracks 
and crevices or spot treatment. Maximum control results if 
facilities to be treated are clean, and coated surfaces are 
cleaned regularly (every 21 days). Apply only to areas to 
areas of the facility where animals are not present. Allow 
the treated coating to dry before allowing animals to re-
enter. Do not apply to animal feed or watering equipment. 

Food/Feed Handling Establishments: For control of all 

labeled pests, applications are permitted in food/feed and 
non-food/non-feed areas of food/free handling and 
processing establishments as spot or crack and crevice 
treatment. 

Food/Feed handling establishments are defined as places 
other than private residences in which exposed food/feed 
is held, processed, prepared or served. Also included are 
areas for receiving, storing, packing (canning, bottling, 
wrapping, boxing), preparing, edible waste storage and 
enclosed processing systems (mills, dairies, edible oils, 
syrups) of food/feed. Serving area where food/feed is 
exposed and the facility is in operation are also considered 
food/feed areas. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 PRODUCT APPLICATION (cont.)                           . 

 Non-Food/Non-Feed Areas: Examples of non-food/non-

feed areas include garbage rooms, lavatories, floor drains 
(to sewers), entries and vestibules, offices, locker rooms, 
machine rooms, boiler rooms, mop closets and storage 
(after packaging, canning or bottling). All areas that 
insects inhabit or through which insects may enter should 
be treated.  

Do not use this application method in the food/feed 
handling areas of the facility when the facility is in 
operation or foods/feeds are exposed. Do not apply 
directly to food/feed products. Cover or remove all 
food/feed processing and/or handling equipment during 
application. After application in food/feed processing 

plants, cafeterias and similar facilities, WASH all 
equipment, benches, shelving and other surfaces which 
food/feed will contact.
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.PHYSICAL PROPERTIES                                                                                                                                              . 

Physical Properties PAINT ADDITIVE INSECTICIDE     

Composition Deltamethrin 

Weight  Per Gallon 8.66 lbs. 

Per Liter 1.04 kg 

Physical State Liquid 

pH 5.0-6.5 

Volatile Organic Compounds 0 g/l  

Shelf Life 1 year 

Practical Coverage Will depend on the coating, method of application and surface type 

Flash Point >200ºF (93ºC)  

Safety Information For additional information, see SDS 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

The technical data and suggestions for use contained herein are correct to the best of our knowledge, and offered in good faith. The 

statements of this literature do not constitute a warranty, express, or implied, as to the performance of these products. As conditions and use 

of our materials are beyond our control, we can guarantee these products only to conform to our standards of quality, and our liability, if any, 

will be limited to replacement of defective materials. All technical information is subject to change without notice.  


